
PRE- SCREENING: Online Educational Module, Health Questionnaire, 
pre-registered with PASS System.  Max 2 Owners allowed per declared 
horse.

ARRIVAL SCREENING: Temperature Check, Photo ID shown and Owners 
accreditation issued. 

ARRIVAL TIME: no sooner than 45 mins before declared horse’s race 

VEHICLE PARKING: Course Enclosure off West Dyke Road. Entry  via 
Cobble Gates.  The postcode for SatNavs is TS10 4HJ. 

TESTING & PEDESTRIAN ENTRANCE: From the car park proceed 
towards the track to the Owners’ Entrance & testing station.  Once 
testing has been completed and accreditation received proceed to the 
course crossing point to access the Owners’ zone in the Paddock Suite.

OWNERS’ ZONE: the Paddock Suite Bar on the ground floor has views 
over the course, and  the balconies on the first floor overlook the 
parade ring, track and have a distant view of the Winners’ Enclosure.  
The Paddock Suite has internal toilet facilities.

RACE VIEWING: from the Paddock Suite balcony or trackside viewing 
area directly outside the Paddock Suite secured by crowd barriers.

REFRESHMENTS: available from the Paddock Suite Bar.

DEBRIEF AREA: the debrief area (double barrier) is located in the area 
between the Paddock Suite , Zetland Bar and Parade Ring.

NO ACCESS allowed to the Parade Ring, Winners’ Enclosure, Weighing 
Room or Stables.   

SANITISER STATIONS are at the Owners’ Entrance / Exit, and at the 
Paddock Suite entrances and inside the facility.

DEPARTURE TIME: no later than 1 hour after their horse’s race. 

PEDESTRIAN EXIT: Exit through one way of the Owners’ Exit.

VEHICLE EXIT: Exit the Centre Course via the Rose Garden Gates onto 
West Dyke Road.  

OWNERS’ BEHIND CLOSED DOORS ARRANGEMENTS 

The “Owners Zone” is a dedicated zone which is separate from other 
raceday workers (trainers, stable staff, jockeys, officials etc) with no 
movement between the two unless for raceday personnel (i.e. cleaning 
team). 

In line with Government Guidance, Owners have been advised that face 
coverings are not mandatory on racecourses but are asked to adhere to 
the BHA’s social distancing advice of 2 meters. 
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